



ITB #:	<u>19-080V</u>	Tentative Board Meeting Date*:	<u>OCTOBER 2, 2018</u>
ITB Title:	<u>TECHNICAL CONTRACT STAFFING & CONSULTING SERVICES</u>	# Notified:	<u>765</u> # Downloaded: <u>51</u>
		# of Responses Rec'd:	<u>43</u> # of "No Bids": <u>0</u>
For:	<u>INFORMATION & TECHNOLOGY</u> (School/Department)	ITB Opening Date :	<u>SEPTEMBER 14, 2018</u>
Fund:	<u>DEPARTMENT'S OPERATING BUDGET</u>	Advertised Date:	<u>SEPTEMBER 06, 2018</u>

POSTING OF ITB RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: ITB Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement & Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on **September 17, 2018 @ 8:00 am** and will remain posted for 72 hours. Any person who is adversely affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of decision or intended decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a notice of protest or failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that "The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based." Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays and days during which the District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action protesting an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by SBBC Policy 3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest.

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / HARD BID, is in effect until it is approved by SBBC. The Board meeting date stated above is tentative. Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION

VENDOR NAME(S)	ITEM AWARDED
22nd Century Technologies, Inc.	1-57
4 Best Business Corp. **	1-57
Abacus Service Corp.	1-57
Alpha 1 Staffing	1-57
B2B Technologies South, LLC	1-6; 11; 14-18; 31-32; 41-50; 52-54
Beacon Systems, Inc. **	1-57
Bleu Stream Corporation	1-57
C & C International Computers & Consultants, Inc. **	1-8; 10-12; 14-18; 21-22; 27-30; 33-57
Capgemini America, Inc. d/b/a Sogeti USA	1-19; 21-54; 57
Cogent Infotech Corp.	1-57
Dell Marketing LP	5-6; 17-18; 41-43; 47-51; 54; 57
Diane Meiller & Associates Incorporated	14-16; 41-43; 45-46; 53; 57
Force 1 Global, Inc.	1-57
Gartner Inc.	14-18; 41-46; 48-49; 53; 57
Genesis Consulting Partners LLC	1-57
Greywood Consulting, Inc.	40-43; 57
Hyper Team USA Business and IT Consulting, Inc.	1-6; 11; 13-18; 24; 26; 31-32; 40-46; 54; 57
Instaff Solutions, LLC **	2-13; 15-38; 41-57
Intelli ERP Software, LLC	1-57
JDL Technologies	5-6; 21-22; 30; 44-50
Levi, Ray and Shoup Inc.	1-18; 20-22; 30-38; 40-54; 56-57
Michael Clark LLC d/b/a Gravity IT Resources LLC	1-54; 57
Millennium Technology Group, LLC **	1-9; 13-19; 21-32; 40-46; 49-50; 56-57

The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities (EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Item #	Quantix Systems, Inc.	RA Dgov, Inc.	Ranger Technical Resources, Inc.	SDTR Consulting LLC	Sierra Infosys, Inc.	Signan & Summerfield Associates, Inc.	Software Information Resource Corp-SIRC	Synchronous Solutions	Synergy Solutions Partners LLC	Tech Army, LLC	TekPartners Solutions, LLC	United Data Technologies	Vision Resources, Inc.	Vivaer and Associates, Inc.
1	\$ 40.00	\$ 54.12	\$ 48.90	\$ 50.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 69.45	\$ 60.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 84.15	\$ 55.00	NO BID	\$ 59.00	\$ 72.03
2	\$ 50.00	\$ 61.11	\$ 59.60	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 74.64	\$ 75.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 104.94	\$ 65.00	NO BID	\$ 69.00	\$ 80.00
3	\$ 60.00	\$ 62.38	\$ 68.00	\$ 89.67	\$ 95.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 93.97	\$ 80.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 115.83	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 102.33
4	\$ 70.00	\$ 63.93	\$ 76.50	\$ 95.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 98.00	\$ 95.46	\$ 100.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 125.73	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 109.00	\$ 124.46
5	\$ 60.00	\$ 68.11	\$ 59.50	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 83.29	\$ 90.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 128.70	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 82.00	\$ 80.50
6	\$ 70.00	\$ 69.66	\$ 72.25	NO BID	\$ 95.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 93.29	\$ 110.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 164.34	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 104.00	\$ 102.44
7	\$ 100.00	\$ 78.60	\$ 76.50	\$ 91.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 92.61	\$ 110.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 138.60	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 95.00	\$ 112.45
8	\$ 100.00	\$ 84.57	\$ 76.50	\$ 106.17	\$ 110.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 104.46	\$ 120.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 136.62	\$ 80.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 118.32
9	\$ 70.00	\$ 68.71	\$ 85.00	\$ 96.52	\$ 110.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 89.77	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 133.65	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 108.00	\$ 100.94
10	\$ 75.00	\$ 67.54	\$ 85.00	\$ 83.49	\$ 110.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 87.32	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 103.95	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 105.00	\$ 117.50
11	\$ 80.00	\$ 78.48	\$ 85.00	\$ 97.98	\$ 100.00	\$ 92.00	\$ 87.57	\$ 110.00	NO BID	\$ 123.75	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 102.00	\$ 100.03
12	\$ 80.00	\$ 67.19	\$ 85.00	\$ 82.16	\$ 110.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 87.32	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 103.95	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 97.00	\$ 105.99
13	\$ 75.00	\$ 68.09	\$ 85.00	\$ 86.96	\$ 100.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 87.57	\$ 90.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 123.75	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 95.00	\$ 79.97
14	\$ 60.00	\$ 53.23	\$ 72.25	\$ 73.50	\$ 80.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 69.65	\$ 55.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 100.98	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 62.00	\$ 68.67
15	\$ 70.00	\$ 64.93	\$ 76.50	\$ 79.17	\$ 90.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 75.22	\$ 65.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 125.73	\$ 78.00	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 82.12
16	\$ 80.00	\$ 73.40	\$ 85.00	\$ 98.64	\$ 100.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 86.15	\$ 75.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 134.64	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 103.00	\$ 109.99
17	\$ 70.00	\$ 53.24	\$ 89.25	\$ 81.20	\$ 90.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 87.63	\$ 120.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 113.85	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 105.00	\$ 95.99
18	\$ 80.00	\$ 67.34	\$ 97.75	\$ 98.43	\$ 110.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 98.86	\$ 135.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 128.70	\$ 80.00	NO BID	\$ 122.00	\$ 125.12
19	\$ 85.00	\$ 73.49	\$ 72.25	NO BID	\$ 100.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 80.73	\$ 75.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 115.83	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 76.00	\$ 68.12
20	\$ 80.00	\$ 58.72	\$ 78.75	NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 74.32	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 103.95	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 88.00	\$ 72.66
21	\$ 35.00	\$ 48.02	\$ 55.25	\$ 48.92	\$ 75.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 46.75	\$ 55.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 64.35	\$ 45.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 46.00	\$ 55.58
22	\$ 45.00	\$ 50.35	\$ 68.00	\$ 53.46	\$ 80.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 54.98	\$ 65.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 79.20	\$ 55.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 58.00	\$ 75.34
23	\$ 50.00	\$ 59.48	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 65.95	\$ 60.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 84.15	\$ 55.00	NO BID	\$ 63.00	\$ 92.46
24	\$ 50.00	\$ 59.94	\$ 76.50	\$ 96.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 84.67	\$ 90.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 133.65	\$ 70.00	NO BID	\$ 78.00	\$ 65.04
25	\$ 60.00	\$ 51.72	\$ 68.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 84.11	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 123.75	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 67.00	\$ 60.02
26	\$ 50.00	\$ 65.90	\$ 72.25	\$ 96.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 79.97	\$ 95.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 133.65	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 76.00	\$ 75.88
27	\$ 60.00	\$ 61.02	\$ 80.75	\$ 96.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 76.39	\$ 90.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 133.65	\$ 75.00	NO BID	\$ 80.00	\$ 79.43
28	\$ 70.00	\$ 61.30	\$ 85.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 84.95	\$ 100.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 123.75	\$ 80.00	NO BID	\$ 73.50	\$ 50.03
29	\$ 75.00	\$ 61.30	\$ 92.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 84.95	\$ 110.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 138.60	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 55.08
30	\$ 65.00	\$ 36.06	\$ 66.50	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 54.95	\$ 55.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 54.45	\$ 50.00	NO BID	\$ 48.00	\$ 45.56
31	\$ 80.00	\$ 71.06	\$ 93.50	\$ 94.66	\$ 85.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 84.89	\$ 110.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 123.75	\$ 95.00	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 100.11
32	\$ 70.00	\$ 59.17	\$ 76.50	\$ 83.45	\$ 85.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 84.89	\$ 80.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 103.95	\$ 80.00	NO BID	\$ 72.00	\$ 95.67
33	\$ 125.00	\$ 90.82	\$ 76.50	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 120.44	\$ 170.00	NO BID	\$ 163.35	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 147.00	\$ 109.99
34	\$ 125.00	\$ 94.42	\$ 76.50	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 118.45	\$ 160.00	NO BID	\$ 143.55	\$ 100.00	NO BID	\$ 152.00	\$ 110.01
35	\$ 125.00	\$ 100.15	\$ 93.50	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 124.01	\$ 150.00	NO BID	\$ 158.40	\$ 110.00	NO BID	\$ 138.00	\$ 115.44
36	\$ 130.00	\$ 98.40	\$ 98.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 125.04	\$ 165.00	NO BID	\$ 168.30	\$ 110.00	NO BID	\$ 118.00	\$ 114.89
37	\$ 120.00	\$ 103.15	\$ 98.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 123.71	\$ 160.00	NO BID	\$ 183.15	\$ 125.00	NO BID	\$ 112.00	\$ 110.00
38	\$ 145.00	\$ 113.82	\$ 113.50	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 138.72	\$ 190.00	NO BID	\$ 173.25	\$ 125.00	NO BID	\$ 132.00	\$ 140.56
39	\$ 125.00	\$ 102.20	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 95.98	\$ 110.00	NO BID	\$ 84.15	\$ 90.00	NO BID	\$ 74.00	\$ 85.12
40	\$ 65.00	\$ 78.28	\$ 42.50	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 74.10	\$ 90.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 118.80	\$ 60.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 63.00	\$ 78.85
41	\$ 75.00	\$ 84.72	\$ 62.50	\$ 85.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 86.45	\$ 110.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 143.55	\$ 70.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 95.23
42	\$ 85.00	\$ 86.89	\$ 76.50	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 99.03	\$ 130.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 163.35	\$ 80.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 110.34
43	\$ 100.00	\$ 90.24	\$ 89.25	\$ 125.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 110.60	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 183.15	\$ 90.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 120.34
44	\$ 65.00	\$ 59.49	\$ 72.25	\$ 75.43	\$ 75.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 87.81	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 108.90	\$ 70.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 69.99
45	\$ 85.00	\$ 61.24	\$ 80.75	\$ 80.32	\$ 85.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 103.05	\$ 80.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 133.65	\$ 80.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 112.00	\$ 78.44
46	\$ 105.00	\$ 63.93	\$ 89.25	\$ 85.21	\$ 95.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 112.04	\$ 105.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 158.40	\$ 90.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 136.00	\$ 99.99
47	\$ 85.00	\$ 98.46	\$ 106.25	NO BID	\$ 125.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 110.97	\$ 135.00	NO BID	\$ 148.50	\$ 100.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 138.00	\$ 119.64
48	\$ 80.00	\$ 84.81	\$ 110.50	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 110.97	\$ 110.00	No Bid	\$ 144.54	\$ 90.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 132.00	\$ 120.76
49	\$ 100.00	\$ 78.48	\$ 77.00	NO BID	\$ 90.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 99.75	\$ 135.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 125.73	\$ 95.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 127.00	\$ 110.32
50	\$ 80.00	\$ 69.18	\$ 72.00	NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 89.46	\$ 95.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 115.83	\$ 85.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 90.65
51	\$ 90.00	\$ 63.40	\$ 93.50	NO BID	\$ 85.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 94.72	\$ 110.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 158.40	\$ 85.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 100.46
52	\$ 80.00	\$ 64.78	\$ 76.50	NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 93.71	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 133.65	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 105.00	\$ 89.32
53	\$ 75.00	\$ 44.18	\$ 106.25	NO BID	\$ 95.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 115.46	\$ 120.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 194.04	\$ 85.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 78.00	\$ 112.78
54	\$ 80.00	\$ 68.06	\$ 105.00	NO BID	\$ 80.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 119.37	\$ 120.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 183.15	\$ 85.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 115.34
55	\$ 85.00	\$ 77.23	\$ 114.75	NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 78.00	\$ 54.98	\$ 90.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 98.01	\$ 80.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 97.45
56	\$ 75.00	\$ 25.30	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 75.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 54.98	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 54.45	\$ 50.00	NO BID	\$ 58.00	\$ 70.12
57	\$ 150.00	\$ 55.45	\$ 102.00	NO BID	\$ 110.00	\$ 128.00	\$ 115.69	\$ 160.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 193.05	\$ 100.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 121.34

REMARK
BIDS REC
Recomm

BID REJECTION SHEET

ITB 19-080V

TECHNICAL CONTRACT STAFFING & CONSULTING SERVICES

It is recommended that for reasons stated below, the bids as stated be rejected for not complying with bid requirements.

- 1) Reject bid from **Apex Systems, LLC**.

Section 3, General Condition 45 - **CERTIFICATION REGARDING DEBARMENT, SUSPENSION, and INELIGIBILITY OR VOLUNTARY EXCLUSION - Lower Tier Covered Transactions**, states: ***Any Bid that does not include this required Form shall not be evaluated and shall not be considered for award.***

Bidder is not responsive as he failed to submit a copy of the CERTIFICATION REGARDING DEBARMENT, SUSPENSION, and INELIGIBILITY OR VOLUNTARY EXCLUSION - Lower Tier Covered Transactions form (Exhibit B)

- 2) Reject bids from **TRG, Inc.**

Bidder is not responsive as he failed to submit any of the required attachments and exhibits as per Section 2 – Submittal Requirements.

Sept 14th, 2018